
 

 
 
Freedom of Information Request: 0469 2019/20 
 

1. Is the catering, retail catering and/or patient dining services on site out-
sourced to any third-party soft facilities providers?  
The Trust has a mix of catering, retail catering– most of these are in house but we 
have a small number of outsourced retail units that are contractors via the PFI 

 
2. If so, please name the external supplier that provides these services, along 

with the contract start/end date?  
We do not hold this information as it falls under the remit of the PFI contract 

 
3. Are the vending services on site managed by an external operated vending  

provider? 
Yes  
 

4. If so, please provide details of the supplier of vending services along with 
details of contract start/end date.  
16.05.2017 – 31.05.2022 

 
5. Are all products provided through the vending machines fully compliant with  

CQUIN guidelines? 
Yes 
 

6. Please provide a planogram of products currently for sale in the snack and 
cold drinks vending machines within the trust.  
We do not hold this information. Our vending machine contract is currently with The 
Vending People.  

 
7. Does the Trust use a ward beverage trolley service to serve hot beverages to 

in-patients throughout the trust?  

 QE   Yes  

 Solihull  No  

 Good Hope  No  

 Heartlands  No  
 

8. If so, please provide details of the number of ward beverage trolleys on site  
along with details of the equipment provider and any contractual obligations  
currently in place including contract start/end date? 
We do not hold this information as these contracts are managed by Engie under a 
PFI contract. 
 

9. What department within the trust manages the above contracts and who within  
the trust is the key point of contact for the above contracts?  
Head Of Catering / Ben Foxall 01213712686 / ben.foxall@uhb.nhs.uk  

 
Please also provide:  
 

1. The total number of vending machines currently on trust grounds split 
between specification of snacks, cold drinks, snack/cold drinks combi and hot 
beverages.  
 

mailto:ben.foxall@uhb.nhs.uk


 

QE Snack machines = 5 
QE Snack / Drinks Combi = 16 
QE Drinks Combi = 4 
QE Hot Drinks = 5 
HGS Snack machines = 18  
HGS Snack / Drinks Combi = 16 

 
2. The amount of NET revenue generated through the vending machines in the  

 Financial year 2018/19.  
We do not hold this information. Our vending machine contract is currently with The 
Vending People.  

 
3. The amount of rebate paid back to the trust as a result of vending machine 

sales in the financial year 2018/19.  
UHB = Approx. 212k 

 
4. The amount of NET revenue generated through the vending machines in the 

financial year 2017/18.  
We do not hold this information. Our vending machine contract is currently with The 
Vending People.  

 
5. The amount of rebate paid back to the trust as a result of vending machine 

sales in the financial year 2017/18.  
Approx. 172k = QE / Solihull / Good Hope / Heartlands Hospital 

 
6. Total rebate paid back to trust as a result of vending sales in the past five 

years. 

 
QEH HGS 

2014/15 
         
£54,679  

         
£118,952  

2015/16 £54,144  £96,829 

2016/17 £49,984  £96,574  

2017/18 £62,703  £110,469  

5018/19 £76,976  £136,648  
 


