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Freedom of Information Request: 0862

I am making a Freedom of Information Act request for the following at Queen
Elizabeth Hospital Birmingham, since it's opening in June 2010.

1. How many times have medical staff at refused to treat a patient?

In line with our Trust procedure, 10 patients have been notified of an exclusion from
treatment / alternative care arrangements, since 2010.

2. What was the ethnicity and nationality of those patients refused treatment?

Please note that nationality is not recorded.

. . Number of
Ethnicity .
patients
White British 8
Black British Caribbean 2

3. What was the age of those patients refused treatment?

Age

Number of Patients

20-29

30-39

40-49

60-69

>80

R ININ|WIN

4. What was the medical condition(s) presenting in those patients?

This information is not recorded.

5. What were the reasons given by medical staff for refusal to treat the patients?

Reason

Number of
patients

Aggressive/Abusive behaviour

9

Crown Court Restraining Order

1
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