

## **FOI REQUEST NUMBER: 5699**

- 1. Firstly, do you have an electronic fax management system (a fax server)? No
- 2. Secondly, how many manual fax machines do you have? Please answer this as of 1 April 2017 and as of 1 April 2010? At April 2017: 113, we do not hold this information for 2010
- 3. Thirdly, what is the annual maintenance cost of the fax machines within your Trust or associated sites? Please answer this as of 1 April 2017 and as of 1 April 2010? We do not hold this information as it is part of Managed Print Service (MPS)>
- **4.** Fourthly, how old is your oldest manual fax machine currently in use? What date was it purchased? Not Applicable, all faxes covered as part of MPS.
- 5. For my second and third queries please insert the data into the following table, should you find this format helpful: Costs are not separated because they are included in the Managed Service

	1 April 2010	1 April 2017
Number of manual fax machines	Not held	113
Annual maintenance cost of fax machines (£)	Not Applicable	Not Applicable