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FOI REQUEST NUMBER: 4971

Intra-occular Lenses

1. When is your current Intraocular lens contract for Ophthalmology up for renewal?
We are currently on the NOE CPC framework for IOL’s which has been extended up to 31/3/17 after which they will have a new framework available
2. Who is your current Intraocular lens provider/providers?

Main provider is Lenstec and we also use Rayner and Alcon

3. How long will your future Intraocular tender contract run for?

We do not hold this information 
4. What is the value of your current intraocular lens contract?


£124,058.67

5. What is the price of your most used IOL?

£40
6. Do you use Toric Lenses for NHS patients or for private?
No

7. Who is your current Toric Lens supplier?
Not applicable 

8. Do you have a Toric pathway?
No

9. What is the price of your most used Toric IOL? 
Not applicable 

a. Do you currently have a managed service in place for Ophthalmology?

No

Cataract Equipment
10. When is your Phaco machinery contract up for renewal?

We do not hold this information, the Directorate will decide when a replacement is needed.
11. How many Phaco machines do you currently have at your sites?

2 (1 x Good Hope & 1 x Solihull)

12. Who is your current provider of the Phaco machinery?

Baush & Lomb
13. How long will the future Phaco contract run for?

We do not hold this information 
14. What is the value of your Phaco machinery?

£150,000
Vitro Retinal (VR) Equipment
15. When is your Vitro retinal machinery contract up for renewal?
We do not provide this service 

16. How many Vitro retinal machines do you currently have at your sites?
Not applicable
17. Who is your current provider of your vitro retinal  machinery?
Not applicable
18. How long will the Vitro retinal contract run for?
Not applicable
19. What is the value of your Vitro retinal machinery?
Not applicable
Cataract and VR Custom PAKS
20. When is your cataract custom PAKS contract up for renewal?

2018
21. Who is your current custom PAKS provider?
Beaver Visitec INT Ltd. 
22. How long will your custom PAKS contract run for?
Has been in place for 5 years 2013-2018
23. What is the value of your Cataracts custom PAKS for the current contract?
Basic VFM Standard pack @ £206 for 6 (£34 single pack) Activity report shows 301 pks of 6 @ £62k per annum. This is the pahco packs from Bausch & Lomb for use with Phaco machine
24. What products are in your standard cataract custom PAK?
Ophthalmic Pack Kits Customeyes kit phaco pack
25. When is your VR custom PAKS contract up for renewal?
Not applicable?
26. Who is your current VR custom PAK provider?
Not applicable?
27. How long will the VR custom PAKS contract run for?
Not applicable?
28. What is the value of your VR custom PAKS for the current contract?
Not applicable?
29. What products are in your standard VR custom PAK?
Not applicable?
30. How many cataract procedures did you do in the financial year 2015 - 2016?
2537
31. How many VR procedures did you do in the financial year 2015 - 2016?
Not applicable 
